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Carneiro of GELEDÉS, Nabor Jr. and Luciane Ramos Silva of
O Menelik 2° Ato, the Brazilian Studies Association (BRASA), and
H-LatAm graciously ceded space in their organizations’ social media
pages for our public postings in search of potential heirs. In the United
States, Marc Hertzman, Dale Graden, Marisol Fila, and Kim Butler
steered our search in productive directions, and Keisha Blain, Herrick
Chapman, Matthew Delmont, Eric Jennings, and Eric Zolov generously
responded to questions on topics outside our areas of expertise. For their
willingness to allow us to republish the works of their ancestors and loved
ones, warmest thanks go to Elisa Larkin Nascimento of IPEAFRO,
Cláudia França dos Santos Antonio, Adriana Moreira, and to Philon
Carneiro, whose untimely death, shortly after we had the pleasure to
correspond with him, we profoundly lament.

At Cambridge University Press, Cecelia Cancellaro and Alejandro de la
Fuente (as Editor and Series Editor respectively) provided unflagging
encouragement, guidance, and feedback as this project took shape. We
also wish to thank the two anonymous readers whose insightful and
generative comments helped us make this book useful and appealing to
as wide a range of readers as possible.

All royalties from Voices of the Race will go toward supporting
Afrodescendant organizations in those four countries.
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A Note on the Text

Throughout this book, readers will find explanatory footnotes for people,
places, concepts, and events that may be unfamiliar. Terms that appear in
more than one article are rendered in boldface on first appearance within
each headnote and article. Full definitions for these terms can be found in
the Glossary at the end of this book. Many Spanish and Portuguese racial
terms, left untranslated and set in italics throughout the book, are also
explained in the Glossary.
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