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Editorial policy  
  
The Journal of Linguistics is concerned with all branches of theoretical linguistics. 
Preference is given to ARTICLES which make a substantial contribution to current 
debate in theoretical linguistics. The language of submission and publication is 
English.  
 
A NOTES AND DISCUSSION contribution is appropriate in particular for comments on 
articles published earlier in JL.  
A BOOK REVIEW is a short summary and evaluation of the content of the book, which 
also contextualises it in terms of current debate. Reviews in JL are generally no more 
than 2000 words in length, as commissioned by the Review Editor. Manuscripts 
which substantially exceed the word limit may be cut or sent back to the author to be 
shortened. If neither is acceptable to the author, the Review Editor may ask for the 
book to be returned so that another reviewer can be found.  Unsolicited book reviews 
are generally not accepted but offers can be made by contacting the Review Editor. 
A REVIEW ARTICLE should be a more substantial piece of work than a book review. It 
should not just summarise and evaluate the book. Rather it should seek to take up 
some of the ideas in the book and take the debate forward either by extending them in 
some way or by taking issue with them. The review article should also seek to place 
the book in its wider linguistic context by referring to other literature within the sub-
field. Potentially, a review article is as important a contribution to the field as an 
ordinary article. For this reason, all review articles will be refereed before publication, 
so as an author you should expect to receive comments and suggestions for changes, 
and should be prepared to revise your initial draft before publication, and to do so 
within a reasonable time-frame. Unsolicited review articles are not accepted but offers 
can be made by contacting the Review Editor. 
  
Submission of an article is taken to imply that it has not previously been published, 
and is not currently under consideration for publication elsewhere. Following 
acceptance of a paper, the author will be asked to assign copyright (on certain 
conditions) to Cambridge University Press. Details can be viewed at 
http://journals.cambridge.org/images/fileUpload/documents/lin_Copyright.pdf. 
 
Contributors are responsible for obtaining permission to reproduce any material in 
which they do not own copyright, to be used in both print and electronic media, and 
for ensuring that the appropriate acknowledgements are included in their manuscript.  
 
Papers accepted for publication in JL are published online, in FirstView, ahead of 
their print publication. Following publication, authors will receive a PDF file with 
their contribution.  
 
Cambridge University Press has introduced a new policy on author self-archiving, 
which applies to JL.  For full details, please see 
http://journals.cambridge.org/openaccess. In short, permissions for author self-
archiving under this policy are as follows: 

http://journals.cambridge.org/openaccess
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This policy is compliant with all known funding mandates and applies no embargo 
period to the non-commercial posting of the Accepted Manuscript.  Under this policy 
Cambridge will remain a SHERPA/RoMEO ‘Green’ Open Access publisher.  On the 
other hand, the policy acts to protect the exclusivity of the final Version of Record by 
prohibiting the posting of this version.  By securing the Version of Record, we secure 
the value of a journal subscription and thus the revenue source on which the ‘Green’ 
model of Open Access relies.   
 
Contact details  
 
General correspondence and offers to contribute to the notes and discussion section 
should be sent by email to the Editors:  
  
Dr S. J. Hannahs 
s.j.hannahs@ncl.ac.uk 
 
Professor Kersti Börjars 
kersti.borjars@manchester.ac.uk 
    
Submissions of articles and related correspondence, general enquiries and questions 
about the form of the manuscript should be sent by email to the Managing Editor:  
  
Dr Ewa Jaworska  
ewa@essex.ac.uk 
 
Book reviews and offers of book reviews and review articles should be sent by email 
to the Review Editor:  
  
Dr Melanie Green  
m.j.green@sussex.ac.uk 
 
Books for review should be sent to the Review Editor at the following address: 
 
Dr Melanie Green 
Review Editor, Journal of Linguistics  

mailto:s.j.hannahs@ncl.ac.uk
mailto:kersti.borjars@manchester.ac.uk
mailto:ewa@essex.ac.uk
mailto:m.j.green@sussex.ac.uk
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Submissions 
 
In order to minimize delays to publication, authors are encouraged to follow the 
instructions below, and the journal’s Style Guide, in the preparation of their 
manuscript.  The Style Guide will be accessed at  
http://journals.cambridge.org/action/displayMoreInfo?jid=LIN&type=ifc. 
 
With minor exceptions spelled out in the Style Guide, JL’s style for References 
follows the Unified Style Sheet for Linguistics Journals 
(http://celxj.org/downloads/UnifiedStyleSheet.pdf; 
http://celxj.org/downloads/unified.bst).  
 
JL welcomes submissions in LaTeX. Please see the Style Guide for further 
information.   
  
Authors should submit to the Managing Editor an anonymous electronic copy of the 
paper in an anonymised PDF file email attachment. The email message must include 
(i) the name(s) of the author(s) and full contact details; (ii) the full title of the paper; 
(iii) an abstract of up to 200 words summarising the content of the paper; (iv) a 
statement of the entire length of the paper in word number; and (v) a statement that 
the paper is not currently under consideration for publication elsewhere. If the paper 
has been refereed as submission to some other publication, please ensure that any 
plausible input from the referees has been incorporated so that those referees’ efforts 
are not neglected. All papers will normally be read by three anonymous referees. All 
abstracts are sent to potential referees and the published version of an article always 
includes an abstract. Please ensure that the abstract is included in the file with the 
paper as well as pasted separately into the submission email  
 
For the purpose of refereeing, an article should be anonymous. This means that the 
name(s) and address(es) of the author(s) should not be included in the file and that, as 
far as possible, the author(s) should not be identifiable from the references in the text 
and the acknowledgements. The file itself should not reveal the author’s identity 
through the information that may be present in the file’s Properties when accessed 
from within the file. (Properties will be found under the File tab.)  
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